
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

VILTER
Component

New (Unused) Oil
Fluid

{not provided} (--- QTS)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline sample for RULer.

Report Id: NORRALNC [WUSCAR] 05749976 (Generated: 09/07/2023 06:35:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL WALKER - NORRALNC

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC05749976 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 25 Jan 2023 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 FLUID DEGRADATION method limit/base current history1 history2

MPC Varnish Potential >15Scale ASTM D7843 1 --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

MPC no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



MPC (Varnish Test)

Report Id: NORRALNC [WUSCAR] 05749976 (Generated: 09/07/2023 06:35:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL WALKER - NORRALNC

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VILTER\New (Unused) Oil [WC05749976] 25 Jan 2023 @ .0 hrs

