
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

HEAR 2
Component

Oil
Fluid

NOT GIVEN (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample. Flash Point COC 324C.

Report Id: METYOU [WUSCAR] 05933048 (Generated: 08/30/2023 19:43:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: AUSTIN AMARAL - METYOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC05933048 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 21 Aug 2023 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 FLUID PROPERTIES method limit/base current history1 history2

COC Flash Point °C ASTM D92 324 --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WC05933048

Lab Number : 05933048

Unique Number : 10618319

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: COC FLASH, KF )

Received : 23 Aug 2023

Diagnosed : 30 Aug 2023

Diagnostician : Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

METALUBE INC

56 CYPRESS DR

YOUNGSVILLE, NC

US  27596

Contact: AUSTIN AMARAL

aamaral@metalubeinc.com

T: 

F: (919)554-3023

Report Id: METYOU [WUSCAR] 05933048 (Generated: 08/30/2023 19:43:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: AUSTIN AMARAL - METYOU

 GRAPHS

Report Id: METYOU [WUSCAR] 05933048 (Generated: 08/30/2023 19:43:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: AUSTIN AMARAL - METYOU

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10618319-4273428&lid=10618319&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	HEAR 2\Oil [WC05933048] 21 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

