
UNKNOWNOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Area

No. 1 Paper Machine
Machine Id

1 PM 2nd Coat Backing Roll Drive Str.#50
Component

Gear Unit
Fluid

ROYAL PURPLE SYNERGY 90/220 (7 GAL)

Report Id: INTTEX [WUSCAR] 05968331 (Generated: 10/10/2023 09:45:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID COTHREN - INTTEX

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : RP0038226

Lab Number : 05968331

Unique Number : 10674882

Test Package : IND 2 ( Additional Tests: PrtCount )

Received : 03 Oct 2023

Diagnosed : 

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

GRAPHIC PACKAGING INTERNATIONAL

9978 FM 3129

QUEEN CITY, TX

US  75572

Contact: DAVID COTHREN

david.cothren@graphicpkg.com

T: (903)796-1690

F: (903)796-1969

Report Id: INTTEX [WUSCAR] 05968331 (Generated: 10/10/2023 09:45:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID COTHREN - INTTEX

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10674882-1789802&lid=10674882&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	WESTINGHOUSE 1 PM 2nd Coat Backing Roll Drive Str.#50\Gear Unit [RP0038226] 29 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

