
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALCOOLANT REPORT

Area

INDUSTRIAL SERVICE SOLUTIONS [39471-2]
Machine Id

SULLAIR 003-140586 - NEWAGE INDUSTRIES
Component

Coolant

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample.

Corrosion

{not applicable}

Contaminants

There is no indication of any contamination in the

coolant.

Coolant Condition

The pH level of this fluid is within the acceptable

limits.

Report Id: UCCUMWIL [WUSCAR] 06026964 (Generated: 01/03/2024 12:35:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Natalie Gagliano - UCCUMWIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info UCH06026964 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 30 Nov 2023 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 65202 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 2000 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info Not Changd --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 CORROSION INHIBITORS method limit/base current history1 history2

Silicon ppm ASTM D6130 24 --- ---

Phosphorus ppm ASTM D6130 <1 --- ---

Boron ppm ASTM D6130 0 --- ---

Molybdenum ppm ASTM D6130 0 --- ---

 CORROSION method limit/base current history1 history2

Iron >15ppm ASTM D6130 0 --- ---

Aluminum >10ppm ASTM D6130 0 --- ---

Copper >10ppm ASTM D6130 <1 --- ---

Lead >10ppm ASTM D6130 <1 --- ---

Tin >10ppm ASTM D6130 <1 --- ---

Zinc ppm ASTM D6130 0 --- ---

 CONTAMINANTS method limit/base current history1 history2

Chlorine ppm ASTM D6130 3 --- ---

 CARRIER SALTS method limit/base current history1 history2

Sodium ppm ASTM D6130 <1 --- ---

Potassium ppm ASTM D6130 0 --- ---

 SCALE POTENTIAL method limit/base current history1 history2

Calcium ppm ASTM D6130 <1 --- ---

Magnesium ppm ASTM D6130 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



COOLANT REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : UCH06026964

Lab Number : 06026964

Unique Number : 10776755

Test Package : IND 2 ( Additional Tests: COOL, GLYCOL, KF, PH )

Recieved : 06 Dec 2023

Diagnosed : 02 Jan 2024

Diagnostician : Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

CUMMINS-WAGNER CO INC

175 Edgemoor Rd

WILMINGTON, DE

US  19809

Contact: Natalie Gagliano

NGagliano@cummins-wagner.com

T: (833)568-5450

F: 

Report Id: UCCUMWIL [WUSCAR] 06026964 (Generated: 01/03/2024 12:35:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Natalie Gagliano - UCCUMWILReport Id: UCCUMWIL [WUSCAR] 06026964 (Generated: 01/03/2024 12:35:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Natalie Gagliano - UCCUMWIL

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

 GRAPHS

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10776755-4351177&lid=10776755&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	SULLAIR SULLAIR 003-140586 - NEWAGE INDUSTRIES\Coolant [UCH06026964] 30 Nov 2023 @ 65202.0 hrs

