
JOHN DEERE 650J 1X2 (S/N T0650JX115101) - DIESEL ENGINESample No: JR0191300
Oil Type: JOHN DEERE ENGINE OIL PLUS 50 II 15W40

NC FOREST SERVICE220 SARDIS RDASHEVILLE, NCUS  28806Contact: LLOYD JOHNSONlloyd.johnson@ncagr.govT: (828)606-7236F: (828)665-0331
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: NCFASHJRUnique No: 10833258Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jan 2024
Report Id: NCFASHJR [WUSCAR] 06061876 (Generated: 05/13/2024 09:36:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LLOYD JOHNSON - NCFASHJR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number JR0191300 JR0157183 JR0117410 JR0071281Sample Date 04 Jan 2024 03 Jan 2023 25 Jan 2022 07 Dec 2020Machine Hours 0 946 872 802Oil Hours 0 0 0 47Oil Changed N/A Changed N/A Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.9 14.2 13.9 14.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.1 9.7 9.2 8.9Oxidation (PA) % 54 63 66 55
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 51 68 52 37Sulfation (PA) % 48 55 59 52Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 7 6 4Sodium ppm 6 1 <1 2Potassium ppm 0 1 1 0
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 9 16 7 4Copper ppm <1 1 <1 <1Lead ppm 2 1 <1 1Tin ppm 2 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 4 3 0 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 48 238 238 23Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 2102 1533 1514 2213Magnesium ppm 80 800 793 106Zinc ppm 1179 1064 1005 1259Phosphorus ppm 924 857 934 1058Barium ppm 0 0 <1 0Boron ppm 43 229 256 120 Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: NCFASHJR [WUSCAR] 06061876 (Generated: 05/13/2024 09:36:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LLOYD JOHNSON - NCFASHJR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 650J 1X2 (S/N T0650JX115101)\Diesel Engine [JR0191300] 04 Jan 2024 @ .0 hrs

