
UNKNOWNOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

ROOTS LR14/9025
Component

Blower
Fluid

TULCO LUBSOIL LPG WS 220 (10 GAL)

Report Id: EASTYL [WUSCAR] 06073844 (Generated: 01/31/2024 16:18:54) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHASE CLIFFORD

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : TO60000482

Lab Number : 06073844

Unique Number : 10855935

Test Package : IND 2 ( Additional Tests: KF, PrtCount )

Recieved : 30 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

EAST TEXAS RENEWABLES

12942 FM 2767

TYLER, TX

US  75705

Contact: CHASE CLIFFORD

cclifford@morrowrenew.com

T: (903)258-3372

F: 

Report Id: EASTYL [WUSCAR] 06073844 (Generated: 01/31/2024 16:18:54) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHASE CLIFFORD

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10855935-4276759&lid=10855935&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	ROOTS ROOTS LR14/9025\Blower [TO60000482] 26 Jan 2024 @ 55468.0 hrs

