
UNKNOWNFUEL REPORT

Machine Id

KIOTI PW50A0337
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

Report Id: CHACHANE [WUSCAR] 06075287 (Generated: 02/02/2024 08:40:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: A. MILLER - CHACHANE

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : KT0000927

Lab Number : 06075287

Unique Number : 10857378

Test Package : DF-2 ( Additional Tests: Screen )

Recieved : 30 Jan 2024

Diagnosed : 

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

CHADRON MOTOR COMPANY

1500 W HWY 20

CHADRON, NE

US  69337

Contact: A. MILLER

amiller@chadronmotors.com

T: (308)432-9004

F: 

Report Id: CHACHANE [WUSCAR] 06075287 (Generated: 02/02/2024 08:40:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: A. MILLER - CHACHANE

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10857378-4371508&lid=10857378&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	KIOTI KIOTI PW50A0337\Diesel Fuel [KT0000927] 26 Jan 2024 @ 82.0 hrs

