
305-E - HYDRAULIC SYSTEMSample No: PH0003651
Oil Type: {unknown}

PLASTIC OMNIUM1549 W BEECHER RDADRIAN, MIUS  49221Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Page 1 of 2



Particle Filter (Magn: 200 x)0µ 300µ 100200

Depot: PLAADRUnique No: 10859756Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 05 Feb 2024
Report Id: PLAADR [WUSCAR] 06077665 (Generated: 04/23/2024 10:18:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - PLAADR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number PH0003651 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 332 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.80 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 6317 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 1266 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 90 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/17/14 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 0 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 2 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 241 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 35 --- --- ---

Page 2 of 2



 GRAPHS
Particle Filter (Magn: 200 x)

0µ 300µ100 200

Report Id: PLAADR [WUSCAR] 06077665 (Generated: 04/23/2024 10:19:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - PLAADR
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	305-E\Hydraulic System [PH0003651] 31 Jan 2024 @ .0 hrs

