
Sample Rating Trend

WATERFUEL REPORT

Area

[W08010437]
Machine Id

VOLVO A45G 352349
Component

Diesel Fuel
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

We recommend drain/flush system.

Contaminants

Sample consists almost entirely of free water.

Water apears to be DEF.

Fuel Condition

The fuel is no longer serviceable due to the

presence of contaminants.

Report Id: VOLVO0264 [WUSCAR] 06101277 (Generated: 03/01/2024 12:53:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: D BUTLER - VOLVO0264

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info VCP362199 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 16 Feb 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 3965 --- ---

Sample Status SEVERE --- ---

 CONTAMINANTS method limit/base current history1 history2

Water <0.05% ASTM D6304 99.0 --- ---

ppm Water <500ppm ASTM D6304 990000 --- ---

% Gasoline <0.50% *In-House 0.0 --- ---

% Biodiesel <20.0% *In-House 0.0 --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



FUEL REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : VCP362199

Lab Number : 06101277

Unique Number : 10899507

Test Package : MOB 1 ( Additional Tests: Bacteria, Color-ASTM, GC-PercFuel, KF, PrtCount, XRF )

Received : 26 Feb 2024

Tested : 01 Mar 2024

Diagnosed : 01 Mar 2024 - Jonathan Hester

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - CHESAPEAKE

4112 HOLLAND BLVD

CHESAPEAKE, VA

US  23323

Contact: D BUTLER

dbutler@mcclung-logan.com

T: 

F: (757)485-3415

Report Id: VOLVO0264 [WUSCAR] 06101277 (Generated: 03/01/2024 12:53:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: D BUTLER - VOLVO0264

 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0264 [WUSCAR] 06101277 (Generated: 03/01/2024 12:53:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: D BUTLER - VOLVO0264

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10899507-4384328&lid=10899507&oem_template=VOLVO
http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352349\Diesel Fuel [VCP362199] 16 Feb 2024 @ 3965.0 hrs

