
AT1169 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVESample No: WC0921983
Oil Type: SHELL OMALA S4 G

MAY HEAVY EQUIPMENT / National Equipment Dealers555 WISE RDCLAYTON, NCUS  27528Contact: SCOTT WOODYswoody@nedealers.comT: F: (919)773-1425
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Bearingand/or gear wear is indicated. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The oil viscosity is lowerthan normal. Confirm oil type.

Depot: TARRALUnique No: 10938248Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Mar 2024
Report Id: TARRAL [WUSCAR] 06124097 (Generated: 04/15/2024 11:38:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT WOODY - TARRAL

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number WC0921983 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4031 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 226 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 23 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 1082 --- --- ---Copper ppm 84 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 11 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 19 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 40 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 417 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 28 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TARRAL [WUSCAR] 06124097 (Generated: 04/15/2024 11:38:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT WOODY - TARRAL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	AT1169\Rear Right Final Drive [WC0921983] 14 Mar 2024 @ 4031.0 hrs

