
Sample Rating Trend

WATERFUEL REPORT

Machine Id

SPLIT REC 90 - SPECTRUM
Component

Tank Gasoline
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

We advise that you follow the water drain-off

procedure for this component, and use off-line

filtration to improve the cleanliness of the system

fluid.

Contamination

There is a light concentration of water present in the

gasoline. Moderate concentration of visible

dirt/debris present in the gasoline. Free water

present.

Fluid Condition

The gasoline is no longer serviceable due to the

presence of contaminants.

Report Id: AGRPALFL [WUSCAR] 06195862 (Generated: 06/11/2024 08:32:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GREG GORKEN - AGRPALFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC0937962 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 23 May 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- ---

 CONTAMINANTS method limit/base current history1 history2

Water <0.05% ASTM D6304 0.390 --- ---

ppm Water <500ppm ASTM D6304 3902 --- ---

% Gasoline <0.50% *In-House 60.4 --- ---

% Biodiesel <20.0% *In-House 0.0 --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



FUEL REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WC0937962

Lab Number : 06195862

Unique Number : 11057985

Test Package : DF-5 ( Additional Tests: Bacteria, Color-ASTM, GC-PercFuel, ICP, KF, KV40, PrtCount, SCREEN, XRF )

Received : 30 May 2024

Tested : 11 Jun 2024

Diagnosed : 11 Jun 2024 - Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

AGRILAND FS, INC

3321 LANDING PLACE

PALM HARBOR, FL

US  34684

Contact: GREG GORKEN

ggorken@agrilandfs.com

T: 

F: 

Report Id: AGRPALFL [WUSCAR] 06195862 (Generated: 06/11/2024 08:32:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GREG GORKEN - AGRPALFL

 GRAPHS

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-11057985-4428796&lid=11057985&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	SPLIT REC 90 - SPECTRUM\Tank Gasoline [WC0937962] 23 May 2024 @ .0 hrs

