
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Area

DONNA PENNANT
Machine Id

LS-043024-01C-245C
Component

Chain
Fluid

{not provided} (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

This is a baseline read-out on the submitted

sample.

Fluid Condition

Linear Sweep Voltammetry (RULER – ASTM

D6971) testing indicates normal levels of anti-

oxidants present in the oil.

Report Id: BASTAR [WUSCAR] 06206021 (Generated: 07/10/2024 12:34:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DONNA PENNANT - BASTAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info WC0946789 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 06 Jun 2024 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 CONTAMINATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Water >0.2WC Method NEG --- ---

 FLUID DEGRADATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Anti-Oxidant 1 <25% ASTM D6971 67 --- ---

Anti-Oxidant 2 <25% ASTM D6971 44 --- ---

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

White Metal NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Yellow Metal NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Precipitate NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Silt NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Debris NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Sand/Dirt NONEscalar *Visual NONE --- ---

Appearance NORMLscalar *Visual NORML --- ---

Odor NORMLscalar *Visual NORML --- ---

Emulsified Water >0.2scalar *Visual NEG --- ---

Free Water scalar *Visual NEG --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : WC0946789

Lab Number : 06206021

Unique Number : 11073482

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: RULER )

Received : 10 Jun 2024

Tested : 10 Jul 2024

Diagnosed : 10 Jul 2024 - Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

BASF - TARRYTOWN

500 WHITE PLAINS RD

TARRYTOWN, NY

US  10591

Contact: DONNA PENNANT

donna.pennant@basf.com

T: 

F: (914)785-2166

Report Id: BASTAR [WUSCAR] 06206021 (Generated: 07/10/2024 12:34:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DONNA PENNANT - BASTAR

 GRAPHS

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-11073482-4434361&lid=11073482&oem_template=WEARCHECK
http://www.tcpdf.org

	LS-043024-01C-245C\Chain [WC0946789] 06 Jun 2024 @ .0 hrs

