
VOLVO L70H 624274 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP364598
Oil Type: OFF ROAD
Job No:

TYLER EQUIPMENT CORPORATION MAIN
PO BOX 544
EAST LONGMEADOW, MA
US  01028
Contact: FRED SMITH
fsmith@tylerequipment.com
T: (413)525-6351
F: (413)525-5909

Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on the
submitted sample.All metal levels are
normal indicating no corrosion in the
system. The water content is
negligible. There is no indication of
any contamination in the fuel. The
condition of the fuel is acceptable for
the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0009
Unique No: 10621756
Signed: Doug Bogart
Report Date: 03 Sep 2023

Report Id: VOLVO0009 [WUSCAR] 05936485 (Generated: 06/13/2024 13:59:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: FRED SMITH - VOLVO0009

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP364598 VCP364640 --- ---
Sample Date 23 Aug 2023 22 Aug 2023 --- ---
Machine Hours 1163 1163 --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---

 FUEL CONDITION

Sulfur ppm 0 12 --- ---
Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.54 2.57 --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.005 0.004 --- ---
Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---
Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---
Aluminum ppm 0 0 --- ---
Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
Silicon ppm <1 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0009 [WUSCAR] 05936485 (Generated: 06/13/2024 13:59:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: FRED SMITH - VOLVO0009
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624274\Diesel Fuel [VCP364598] 23 Aug 2023 @ 1163.0 hrs

