
VOLVO L70H 625046 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP443315
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY
5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVD
FORT MYERS, FL
US  33905
Contact: TODD LARK
tlark@altaequipfl.com
T: 
F: (239)481-3302

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The BN
result indicates that there is suitable
alkalinity remaining in the oil. The
condition of the oil is suitable for
further service.

Depot: VOLVO0090
Unique No: 11059537
Signed: Wes Davis
Report Date: 04 Jun 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06197414 (Generated: 06/04/2024 09:33:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP443315 VCP433515 --- ---
Sample Date 29 May 2024 28 Nov 2023 --- ---
Machine Hours 1639 870 --- ---
Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---
Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.8 --- ---
Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 8.6 --- ---
Oxidation (PA) % 80 75 --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG NEG --- ---
Soot % % 0.3 0.3 --- ---
Nitration (PA) % 68 65 --- ---
Sulfation (PA) % 59 58 --- ---
Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---
Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---
Silicon ppm 8 19 --- ---
Sodium ppm <1 3 --- ---
Potassium ppm 2 <1 --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 21 32 --- ---
Copper ppm 3 9 --- ---
Lead ppm <1 1 --- ---
Tin ppm 2 3 --- ---
Aluminum ppm 6 16 --- ---
Chromium ppm 2 2 --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 48 50 --- ---
Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---
Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---
Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---
Manganese ppm <1 4 --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1710 1723 --- ---
Magnesium ppm 510 633 --- ---
Zinc ppm 1153 1377 --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 961 1118 --- ---
Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---
Boron ppm 32 65 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06197414 (Generated: 06/04/2024 09:33:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


VOLVO L70H 625046 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP447737
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY
5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVD
FORT MYERS, FL
US  33905
Contact: TODD LARK
tlark@altaequipfl.com
T: 
F: (239)481-3302

Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommended
at this time. Resample at the next
service interval to monitor.The iron
level is abnormal. All other
component wear rates are normal.
There is no indication of any
contamination in the fluid. The
condition of the fluid is acceptable
for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0090
Unique No: 11060211
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 05 Jun 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06198088 (Generated: 06/05/2024 12:19:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP447737 VCP434284 --- ---
Sample Date 29 May 2024 28 Nov 2023 --- ---
Machine Hours 1639 870 --- ---
Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---
Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---
Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---

 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 27.6 28.1 --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG NEG --- ---
Silicon ppm 11 3 --- ---
Sodium ppm 4 41 --- ---
Potassium ppm 3 8 --- ---

 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 165 33 --- ---
Copper ppm 8 <1 --- ---
Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---
Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---
Aluminum ppm <1 12 --- ---
Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---
Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---
Manganese ppm 10 <1 --- ---
Vanadium ppm <1 1 --- ---

 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 82 11 --- ---
Magnesium ppm 1 <1 --- ---
Zinc ppm 39 0 --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 212 33 --- ---
Barium ppm 2 2 --- ---
Boron ppm 68 4 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06198088 (Generated: 06/05/2024 12:20:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 625046\Diesel Engine [VCP443315] 29 May 2024 @ 1639.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 625046\Transmission (Auto) [VCP447737] 29 May 2024 @ 1639.0 hrs

