
VOLVO A30G 752655 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP442831
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT
5985 COURT STREET ROAD
SYRACUSE, NY
US  13206
Contact: JIM STRIGLE
JIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COM
T: (315)437-2611
F: (315)434-9471

Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommended
at this time. The fluid is suitable for
further service. There is no indication
of any contamination in the coolant.
Carboxylate test failed. The glycol
level is acceptable. The pH level of
this fluid is within the acceptable
limits.

Depot: VOLVO0142
Unique No: 10897072
Signed: Jonathan Hester
Report Date: 28 Feb 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098842 (Generated: 02/28/2024 09:05:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP442831 --- --- ---
Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 1922 --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.08 --- --- ---
Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---
Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---
Percentage Glycol % 49.8 --- --- ---
Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---
Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098842 (Generated: 02/28/2024 09:05:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


VOLVO A30G 752655 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP442841
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT
5985 COURT STREET ROAD
SYRACUSE, NY
US  13206
Contact: JIM STRIGLE
JIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COM
T: (315)437-2611
F: (315)434-9471

Diagnosis
The oil change at the time of
sampling has been noted. Resample
at the next service interval to
monitor.Exhaust valve wear is
indicated. Fuel content negligible.
There is no indication of any
contamination in the oil. The oil
viscosity is lower than normal. The
BN result indicates that there is
suitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.
Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0142
Unique No: 10896435
Signed: Jonathan Hester
Report Date: 28 Feb 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098205 (Generated: 02/28/2024 08:00:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP442841 --- --- ---
Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 1922 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 --- --- ---
Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.8 --- --- ---
Oxidation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---
Nitration (PA) % 53 --- --- ---
Sulfation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---
Glycol % NEG --- --- ---
Fuel % 0.3 --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 13 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 40 --- --- ---
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---
Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 54 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm 9 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1158 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 752 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 1020 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 940 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 11 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098205 (Generated: 02/28/2024 08:00:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


VOLVO A30G 752655 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP442842
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT
5985 COURT STREET ROAD
SYRACUSE, NY
US  13206
Contact: JIM STRIGLE
JIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COM
T: (315)437-2611
F: (315)434-9471

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the fluid. The
condition of the fluid is acceptable
for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142
Unique No: 10897021
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 26 Feb 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098791 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:05:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP442842 --- --- ---
Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 1922 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 29.4 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 56 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 25 --- --- ---
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---
Tin ppm 5 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 29 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 75 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 10 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 165 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 67 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098791 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:05:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


VOLVO A30G 752655 - BRAKE

Sample No: VCP427146
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL WB102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT
5985 COURT STREET ROAD
SYRACUSE, NY
US  13206
Contact: JIM STRIGLE
JIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COM
T: (315)437-2611
F: (315)434-9471

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The
condition of the oil is acceptable for
the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142
Unique No: 10896969
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 26 Feb 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098739 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP427146 --- --- ---
Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 1922 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 44.1 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 17 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 44 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 146 --- --- ---
Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---
Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 3225 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 1289 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 1146 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 109 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098739 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


VOLVO A30G 752655 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP442836
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT
5985 COURT STREET ROAD
SYRACUSE, NY
US  13206
Contact: JIM STRIGLE
JIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COM
T: (315)437-2611
F: (315)434-9471

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The
condition of the oil is acceptable for
the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142
Unique No: 10896963
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 26 Feb 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098733 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP442836 --- --- ---
Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 1922 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 85.3 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 282 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 24 --- --- ---
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---
Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 5 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 890 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 355 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 1198 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 222 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098733 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


VOLVO A30G 752655 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP442834
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT
5985 COURT STREET ROAD
SYRACUSE, NY
US  13206
Contact: JIM STRIGLE
JIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COM
T: (315)437-2611
F: (315)434-9471

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The
condition of the oil is acceptable for
the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142
Unique No: 10896966
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 26 Feb 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098736 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP442834 --- --- ---
Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 1922 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 89.2 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 245 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 23 --- --- ---
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---
Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 649 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 267 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 1182 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 5 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 226 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098736 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


VOLVO A30G 752655 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP442835
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT
5985 COURT STREET ROAD
SYRACUSE, NY
US  13206
Contact: JIM STRIGLE
JIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COM
T: (315)437-2611
F: (315)434-9471

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The
condition of the oil is acceptable for
the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0142
Unique No: 10896968
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 26 Feb 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098738 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP442835 --- --- ---
Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 1922 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 2000 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 89.4 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 207 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 20 --- --- ---
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---
Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 5 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 818 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 325 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 1205 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 5 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 235 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098738 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:04:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752655\Coolant [VCP442831] 16 Feb 2024 @ 1922.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752655\Diesel Engine [VCP442841] 16 Feb 2024 @ 1922.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752655\Transmission (Auto) [VCP442842] 16 Feb 2024 @ 1922.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752655\Brake [VCP427146] 16 Feb 2024 @ 1922.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752655\Front Axle [VCP442836] 16 Feb 2024 @ 1922.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752655\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP442834] 16 Feb 2024 @ 1922.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752655\Rear Axle [VCP442835] 16 Feb 2024 @ 1922.0 hrs

