
[[X28006]] VOLVO A25G 752153 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCBM007630
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X28006

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Memphis
4515 PIDGEON ROOST ROAD
MEMPHIS, TN
US  38118
Contact: PHLLIP SIMMONS
psimmons@scottcompanies.com
T: (901)570-2113
F: (901)346-8865

Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time of
sampling has been noted. No
corrective action is recommended at
this time. Resample at the next
service interval to monitor.All
component wear rates are normal.
Fuel content negligible. No other
contaminants were detected in the
oil. The BN result indicates that there
is suitable alkalinity remaining in the
oil. The condition of the oil is
acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0123
Unique No: 10993685
Signed: Sean Felton
Report Date: 25 Apr 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0123 [WUSCAR] 06158262 (Generated: 04/26/2024 09:07:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PHLLIP SIMMONS - VOLVO0123

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCBM007630 --- --- ---
Sample Date 18 Apr 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 2730 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 --- --- ---
Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 --- --- ---
Oxidation (PA) % 47 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---
Nitration (PA) % 50 --- --- ---
Sulfation (PA) % 50 --- --- ---
Glycol % NEG --- --- ---
Fuel % 0.7 --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 8 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---
Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 39 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1856 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 217 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 1134 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 983 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 172 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0123 [WUSCAR] 06158262 (Generated: 04/26/2024 09:07:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PHLLIP SIMMONS - VOLVO0123
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752153\Diesel Engine [VCBM007630] 18 Apr 2024 @ 2730.0 hrs

