
[[PRINCE]] VOLVO L90H 627129 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437332
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: PRINCE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC
8418 PALM RIVER ROAD
TAMPA, FL
US  33619
Contact: KENNY HANEY
khaney@flaglerce.com
T: (813)630-0077
F: (813)630-2233

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The BN
result indicates that there is suitable
alkalinity remaining in the oil. The
condition of the oil is suitable for
further service.

Depot: VOLVO0093
Unique No: 11077114
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 17 Jun 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06209653 (Generated: 06/19/2024 10:59:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP437332 --- --- ---
Sample Date 09 Apr 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 908 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 --- --- ---
Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.0 --- --- ---
Oxidation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---
Nitration (PA) % 43 --- --- ---
Sulfation (PA) % 56 --- --- ---
Glycol % NEG --- --- ---
Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 6 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---
Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 65 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1394 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 383 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 1092 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 858 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 330 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06209653 (Generated: 06/19/2024 10:59:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


[[PRINCE]] VOLVO L90H 627129 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP444776
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: PRINCE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC
8418 PALM RIVER ROAD
TAMPA, FL
US  33619
Contact: KENNY HANEY
khaney@flaglerce.com
T: (813)630-0077
F: (813)630-2233

Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommended
at this time. Resample at the next
service interval to monitor.The iron
level is abnormal. All other
component wear rates are normal.
There is no indication of any
contamination in the fluid. The
condition of the fluid is acceptable
for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093
Unique No: 11083475
Signed: Angela Borella
Report Date: 17 Jun 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06210611 (Generated: 06/17/2024 16:48:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP444776 --- --- ---
Sample Date 09 Apr 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 908 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---
Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 28.4 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 176 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---
Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---
Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 71 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 36 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 184 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 74 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06210611 (Generated: 06/17/2024 16:48:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


[[PRINCE]] VOLVO L90H 627129 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP437499
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: PRINCE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC
8418 PALM RIVER ROAD
TAMPA, FL
US  33619
Contact: KENNY HANEY
khaney@flaglerce.com
T: (813)630-0077
F: (813)630-2233

Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filters
on this component. Resample at the
next service interval to monitor. We
were unable to perform a particle
count due to a high concentration of
particles present in this sample.All
component wear rates are normal.
Moderate concentration of visible
dirt/debris present in the oil. The AN
level is acceptable for this fluid. The
condition of the oil is suitable for
further service.

Depot: VOLVO0093
Unique No: 11082862
Signed: Don Baldridge
Report Date: 17 Jun 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06209998 (Generated: 06/19/2024 10:59:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP437499 --- --- ---
Sample Date 09 Apr 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 908 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---
Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 44.4 --- --- ---
Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.41 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 3 --- --- ---
Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---
Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---
Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 70 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 484 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 356 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06209998 (Generated: 06/19/2024 10:59:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


[[PRINCE]] VOLVO L90H 627129 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP445555
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: PRINCE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC
8418 PALM RIVER ROAD
TAMPA, FL
US  33619
Contact: KENNY HANEY
khaney@flaglerce.com
T: (813)630-0077
F: (813)630-2233

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The
condition of the oil is acceptable for
the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093
Unique No: 11083363
Signed: Wes Davis
Report Date: 17 Jun 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06210499 (Generated: 06/17/2024 20:27:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP445555 --- --- ---
Sample Date 09 Apr 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 908 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 41.2 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 17 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 61 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---
Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---
Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 17 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 4010 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 1653 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 1308 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 134 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06210499 (Generated: 06/17/2024 20:27:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org


[[PRINCE]] VOLVO L90H 627129 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP451207
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: PRINCE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC
8418 PALM RIVER ROAD
TAMPA, FL
US  33619
Contact: KENNY HANEY
khaney@flaglerce.com
T: (813)630-0077
F: (813)630-2233

Diagnosis
Resample at the next service interval
to monitor.All component wear rates
are normal. There is no indication of
any contamination in the oil. The
condition of the oil is acceptable for
the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093
Unique No: 11083365
Signed: Wes Davis
Report Date: 17 Jun 2024

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06210501 (Generated: 06/17/2024 20:27:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VCP451207 --- --- ---
Sample Date 09 Apr 2024 --- --- ---
Machine Hours 908 --- --- ---
Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---
Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---
Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 41.3 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---
Silicon ppm 20 --- --- ---
Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 53 --- --- ---
Copper ppm 84 --- --- ---
Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---
Tin ppm 9 --- --- ---
Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---
Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---
Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---
Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---
Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---
Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---
Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---
Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 3996 --- --- ---
Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---
Zinc ppm 1636 --- --- ---
Phosphorus ppm 1281 --- --- ---
Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---
Boron ppm 135 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06210501 (Generated: 06/17/2024 20:27:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 627129\Diesel Engine [VCP437332] 09 Apr 2024 @ 908.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 627129\Transmission (Auto) [VCP444776] 09 Apr 2024 @ 908.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 627129\Hydraulic System [VCP437499] 09 Apr 2024 @ 908.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 627129\Front Axle [VCP445555] 09 Apr 2024 @ 908.0 hrs
	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 627129\Rear Axle [VCP451207] 09 Apr 2024 @ 908.0 hrs

